
Lisbellaw Triumphs Over Lisnaskea Rovers with a 4-0 Victory 

Lisbellaw, March 14, 2025 – Lisbellaw FC put on an impressive display of skill and 
teamwork as they triumphed 4-0 over rivals Lisnaskea Rovers in a thrilling soccer match at 
Castle Park Centre on Monday evening. 

From the start, Lisbellaw dominated possession, pressing high and creating several chances 
within the first 10 minutes. Their relentless offensive play paid off with a corner kick from 
Cahir that swung into Micheal to flick home to the back of the net. The early goal set the tone 
for what was to become a one-sided affair. 

Lisnaskea Rovers struggled to break down Lisbellaw’s defensive setup, with the defence trio 
of Thomas, Darryl and Tom controlling the pace of the game. Lisnaskea's best opportunity 
came in the 35th minute, but a stunning save from Lisbellaw goalkeeper John denied them a 
chance to equalize. 

The second half saw no change in momentum, with Lisbellaw continuing to assert their 
dominance. In the 52nd minute, Eoghan struck, firing a powerful shot from just outside the 
box that sailed into Issac J to make a great finish to make it 2-0. The Rovers' defense, already 
under pressure, was unable to cope with the speed and accuracy of Lisbellaw's attacking play 
from Eoghan, Cahir and Issac J. 

As the game progressed, Lisbellaw sealed their victory with two more goals in quick 
succession. In the 68th minute, midfielder Micheal delivered a perfect through ball who 
calmly finished past the Lisnaskea goalkeeper for 3-0. Just five minutes later, a blistering 
short shot from Rory added another to the scoreline, leaving Lisnaskea with little time to 
mount a comeback. 

Despite some late pressure from Lisnaskea in the final stages of the match, Lisbellaw's 
defense with Issac W holding firm, and the final whistle confirmed the 4-0 scoreline. It was a 
dominant performance from the home side, who were lauded for their clinical finishing, 
defensive solidity, and cohesive team play. 

Lisbellaw's manager, Lee and Dooley, praised their team's professionalism and composure. "I 
couldn’t be happier with the way the lads played today. We stuck to our game plan, and the 
result speaks for itself. We showed great quality going forward and defended resolutely when 
we needed to. A fantastic team effort." 

The defeat leaves Lisnaskea Rovers with much to reflect on, as they will need to regroup and 
focus on their next match to get back to winning ways. 

Lisbellaw will look to carry this momentum into their next fixture, where they aim to 
continue their climb up the league standings. 

Final Score: 
Lisbellaw FC 4-0 Lisnaskea Rovers 

Goals: 
1-0: Micheal (23’) 
2-0: Issac J (52’) 



3-0:Micheal(68’) 
4-0: Rory (73’) 

Man of the Match: Micheal and Eoghan (Lisbellaw FC) 
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